Comal County
040-2011-132
Oil, Lubricants, and Transmission Fluids

) Schaeffer's
Amsoil/ Nee‘dmore Dixie Oil Company | Kino Oil Company | Rush Truck Center Specialized Wright Oil
Synthetics .
Lubricants
Est. Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
item# Quantity (UOM Description Unit Price| Price |UnitPrice| Price |UnitPrice Price | Unit Price Price | Unit Price Price | Unit Price Price

Engine Oil SAE Grade 5W30,

1 1925|GL Full Synthetic 15.56, 29,953.00 13.90{ 26,757.50 13.90 26,757.50 29.44] 56,672.00 20.33} 39,135.25 10.55] 20,308.75
Engine Oil, SAE Grade 5W40,

2 1375|GL Full Synthetic 25.80] 35,475.00 10.96] 15,070.00 15.52] 21,340.00 31.61} 43,463.75 20.731 28,503.75 11.69} 16,073.75
Automatic Transmission

3 440|GL Fluid, Full Synthetic 30.00] 13,200.00 16.59] 7,299.60 16.58| 7,295.20 24.95] 10,978.00 23.92] 10,524.80 12.79] 5,627.60
Transmission Gear Oil, SAE

4 25|GL 50, Full Synthetic 36.75 918.75 150.26] 3,756.50 22.54 563.50 26.01 650.25 62.08! 1,552.00 30.79 769.75
SAE Grade 80W140 OR
75W140 Gear Oil, Full

5 330|GL Synthetic 32.30] 10,659.00 19.75{ 6,517.50 19.75{ 6,517.50 24.35] 8,035.50 44.721 14,757.60 24.59] 8,114.70
Automatic Transmission

6 48 1QT Fluid, ATF + 4 8.90 427.20 4.32 207.36 4.32 207.36 3.03 145.44 7.64 366.72 2.37 113.76
Automatic Tranmission Fluid

7 1201QT "Sp 8.90| 1,068.00 4.32 518.40 4.32 518.40|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Automatic Tranmission Fluid

8 360iQT "L 8.90] 3,204.00 4.32| 1,555.20{No Bid No Bid 4.85¢ 1,746.00{No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grease Extreme Duty,
Synthetic Blend, Multi-

9 432{Tube purpose NLGI #2 5.68| 2,453.76|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.76] 1,624.32 4.06| 1,753.92 2.56] 1,105.92
10 220|GL AW68 Hydraulic Oil 26.40! 5,808.00 7.521 1,654.40 8.97| 1,973.40 12.97| 2,853.40 14.821 3,260.40 8.27| 1,819.40
11 220{GL Tractor Oil 25.05| 5,511.00 8.38| 1,843.60 9.731 2,140.60 12.58| 2,767.60 15.66] 3,445.20 9.33) 2,052.60

AWG68, 35KV, Conductive
12 30|GL Resistant Hydraulic Oil 29.15 874.50 8.27 248.10 9.22 276.60 14.28 428.40{No Bid No Bid 9.07 272.10




