
COMAL COUNTY

BID 2011-133

FOOD SERVICE FOR THE COMAL COUNTY JAIL FACILITY

BID SHEET

ITEM DESCRIPTION

 PER 

POUND 

 PER 

CASE 

CASE 

COUNT NOTES

 PER 

POUND 

 PER 

CASE 

CASE 

COUNT NOTES

 PER 

POUND 

 PER 

CASE 

CASE 

COUNT Notes
1 Frozen Hamburger Mix (80-20) 8/5# 2.060$    80 lbs 2.290$     8/5 lbs No Bid

2 Pulled Chicken Meat - mixed - Boneless - pre-cooked Tyson 3.000$    30.04$    10 lbs 2.974$     29.74$     10 lbs No Bid

3 Beef Tamales 49.06$    87 ea 32.26$     120 ea 2 oz No Bid

4 Frozen Beef Stew Meat - Raw 2.240$    44.80$    20 lbs 3.960$     20 lbs No Bid

5 Chicken Strips, Tyson 2/5lb 1.786$    17.86$    10 lbs 28.91$     150 ea 1.14 oz No Bid

25.65$     10 lbs Sub Offered

6 3oz Salisbury Steak Patty - pre-cooked 46.95$    114 ea 44.97$     114 ea No Bid

7 3oz Breaded Chicken Patty - Pre-cooked - Tyson 17.48$    60 ea 13.09$     52 ea 3.1 oz No Bid

8 3oz. Hamburger Patty - Pre-Cooked 38.66$    90 ea 62.18$     81 ea No Bid

9 3oz. Chicken Fried Steak Patty - Pre-Cooked 30.45$    53 ea 18.76$     40 ea 3.88 oz No Bid

10 96 3oz. Tony's pizza sausage - pre cooked 4X6" 48.52$    96 ea 44.95$     96 ea 4.78 oz No Bid

11 Frozen Chopped Bar-B-Q - pre-cooked 4/5# 2.560$    51.14$    20 lbs 34.74$     4/5 lbs No Bid

12 Steak Finger, 160/.97 21.22$    160 ea 18.52$     160 ea No Bid

13 Turkey Franks (hot dogs) 1.488$    14.88$    10 lbs 11.44$     10 lbs No Bid

14 Turkey Corn Dogs 48/4oz 24.59$    48 ea 24.88$     72 ea No Bid

15 Turkey Bologna Stick (Not Sliced) 1.14$       2/10 lbs No Bid

Central Poly CorpLabatt Food ServiceBen E. Keith

NO BID
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BID 2011-133

FOOD SERVICE FOR THE COMAL COUNTY JAIL FACILITY

BID SHEET16 Oval Turkey Ham 1.190$    19.04$    16 lbs 2.110$     2/5-6 lbs No Bid

17 Deli Turkey Pastrami 1.990$    23.84$    12 lbs 3.020$     6/2 lbs No Bid

18 Turkey Sausage Patty Pre-Cooked 1.5oz 33.98$    128 ea 32.87$     160 ea 1.025 oz No Bid

19 Pork Sausage Patty Pre-cooked Pork 1.3oz 29.42$    154 ea 26.20$     107 ea 1.5 oz No Bid

20 Libby Chili-No Beans 66.52$    6 cans 45.65$     6 cans No Bid

21 3oz. Polish Sausage link 24.55$    50 ea 26.88$     10 lbs No Bid

22 Swanson Chicken Pot Pies 24/7oz 18.55$    27 ea 19.56$     24 ea No Bid

23 Fresh tomatoes 5X6 2 layer 1.110$    22.22$    20 lbs 28.04$     20 lbs No Bid

24 Fresh head Lettuce 6 ct. 23.33$    24 ea 13.98$     6 ct No Bid

25 Salad Mix w/color 0.740$    14.70$    20 lbs 17.71$     4/5 lbs No Bid

26 Shredded Chicken, 8/5 lb white/dark 3.000$    30.04$    10 lbs No Bid

27 Vegetarian Baked Beans 6#, 10 cans 30.61$    6 cans 27.35$     6 cans No Bid

28 Ready to use Elbow Macaroni Salad 0.040$    31.26$    24 lbs 28.21$     3/8 lbs No Bid

29 Ready to use Potato Salad 1.290$    41.31$    32 lbs 34.74$     30 lbs No Bid

30 Fresh Spinach 1.667$    16.67$    10 lbs 18.06$     4/2.5 lbs No Bid

31 Frozen Mixed Vegetables 20# 0.930$    18.50$    20 lbs 16.72$     20 lbs No Bid

32 Shredded Lettuce 0.700$    14.04$    20 lbs 16.43$     4/5 lbs No Bid

NO BID
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BID SHEET33 Frozen Sliced carrots 20# 11.58$     20 lbs No Bid

34 Frozen Broccoli cuts 0.900$    17.94$    20 lbs 19.40$     12/2.5 lbs No Bid

35 Frozen Sliced Yellow Squash 0.900$    18.06$    20 lbs 27.85$     12/3 lbs No Bid

36 Frozen Italian blend vegetables 1.100$    26.43$    24 lbs 19.15$     20 lbs No Bid

37 Pinto Beans #10 can 22.68$    6 cans 21.97$     6 cans No Bid

38 Green Peas #10 Can 23.89$    6 cans 28.88$     6 cans No Bid

39 Whole Kernel Corn #10 Can 26.27$    6 cans 25.38$     6 cans No Bid

40 Short cut green beans #10 Can 24.69$     6 cans No Bid

41 Pork and Beans #10 can 24.10$    6 cans 23.69$     6 cans No Bid

42 Green Chilies Canned 12/26 oz. 38.99$    12 cans 36.19$     12 cans 27 oz No Bid

43 Diced Tomatoes in Juice #10 can 16.85$    6 cans 17.48$     6 cans No Bid

44 Rotel Tomatoes with Green Chilies 28oz. Can 18.92$    12 cans 23.14$     12 cans No Bid

45 Tomato Sauce #10 can 20.53$    6 cans 17.01$     6 cans No Bid

46 Fritos 8 16 oz bags per case 1.750$    13.99$    8 lbs 13.23$     8/16 oz No Bid

47 Shredded cheese - Monterey Jack 4/5# bags 2.590$    25.92$    10 lbs 58.32$     4/5 lbs No Bid

48 Sliced cheese - American (not Light) 2.240$    67.06$    30 lbs 42.99$     4/5 lbs No Bid

49 Parmesan cheese grated 1/5# 2.800$    56.00$    20 lbs 18.25$     5 lbs No Bid

NO BID

NO BID
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BID SHEET50 Stuffing Mix cornbread 2.580$    57.30$    22.2 lbs 55.70$     6/3.5 lbs No Bid

51 Rice Long grain 1/25# Bag 0.390$    9.81$       25 lbs 10.89$     25 lbs No Bid

52 Uncle Bens Rice Pilaf 6/36oz 27.90$    6 ea 23.79$     6 ea No Bid

53 Manwich Sauce, 4/#10 0.560$    22.45$    40 lbs 20.58$     40 lbs No Bid

54 Uncle Bens Spanish Rice 6/36oz 41.51$    6 ea 23.58$     6 ea No Bid

55 Sunny Egg Patties 33.94$    153 ea 49.17$     234 ea 1.5 oz No Bid

56 Wide Egg Noodles 1.220$    12.22$    10 lbs 12.76$     10 lbs No Bid

57 Spaghetti Noodles 10" 1.828$    18.28$    20 lbs 16.53$     2/10 lbs No Bid

58 Oven Fries - Frozen Pre cooked 1.030$    30.95$    30 lbs 20.89$     6/5 lbs No Bid

59 Apricots 6/10# Cans 36.27$    6 cans 35.58$     6 cans No Bid

60 Fruit Cocktail #10 Can 31.14$    6 cans 35.18$     6 cans No Bid

61 Applesauce #10 Can 27.86$    6 cans 28.80$     6 cans No Bid

62 Ind. Applesauce Sugar Free 22.59$    72 ea 19.83$     72 ea 4 oz No Bid

63 Sliced Peaches #10 Can 32.11$    6 cans 31.57$     6 cans No Bid

64 Sliced Pears #10 Can 28.72$    6 cans 26.70$     6 cans No Bid

65 Parsley Flakes 9.61$       10 oz 7.95$       1.69 lbs No Bid

66 Taco Seasoning Mix 5.570$    8.35$       24 oz 8.22$       6/9oz No Bid
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BID SHEET67 Garlic Powder 5.520$    27.62$    5 lbs 26.75$     1/6 lbs No Bid

68 Black Pepper, 14 oz 8.35$       18 oz 6.36$       16 oz No Bid

69 Iodized Salt - 26 box 12.62$    26 ea 9.65$       24 ea 26 oz No Bid

70 Tropical Fruit 6# 10 cans 36.22$    6 cans 34.42$     6 cans No Bid

71 Ground Ginger 12.150$  12.15$    1 lb 5.01$       1/16 oz No Bid

72 Brown Sugar 25# bag 22.58$     25 lbs No Bid

73 Peanut Butter squezers ind. Packets 47.41$    200 ea 41.18$     200 ea 1.12 oz No Bid

74 Mandarin Oranges 6# 10 can 35.06$    6 cans 34.20$     6 cans No Bid

75 Yogurt, 6/32 oz 14.75$    6 ea 14.15$     6 ea No Bid

76 Mayonnaise - Individual packages 15.72$    200 ea 6.54$       200 ea 12 gms No Bid

77 Mustard - Ind.  Packets 12.00$    500 ea 4.14$       500 ea 4.5 gms No Bid

78 Ranch dressing Ind. Packets 7.20$       200 ea 7.05$       200 ea 12 gms No Bid

79 French Dressing Ind. Packets 6.49$       200 ea 6.49$       200 ea 12 gms No Bid

80 Italian Dressing Ind. Packets 5.44$       200 ea 5.50$       200 ea 12 gms No Bid

81 Margarine - oleo readies 1.370$    16.44$    12 lbs 17.93$     900/5gm No Bid

82 Oleo All-Veg. Solid 0.760$    22.65$    30 lbs 22.13$     30 lbs No Bid

83 Jelly Low Cal. Ind. Packets 9.83$       200 ea 9.93$       200 ea 12 gms No Bid

NO BID
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BID SHEET84 Jelly Ind. Packets 6.63$       200 ea 8.66$       200 ea .5 oz No Bid

85 Frosted Flakes, 4-32oz bags 29.29$    4 ea 19.15$     4 ea No Bid

86 Tasteeos 4-32 oz bags 29.21$    4 ea 20.42$     4 ea No Bid

87 Fruit Rings 4-32 oz bags 26.99$    4 ea 20.42$     4 ea No Bid

88 Cream Cheese, 100/1oz 17.23$    100 ea 14.61$     100 ea No Bid

89 Vanilla pudding #10 can 28.23$    6 cans 24.01$     6 cans No Bid

90 Cinamon Roll, 3/12 ct 18.33$    30 ea 18.91$     3/12 ct No Bid

91 Crystal Light, 4/30ct 29.33$    120 ea 26.55$     30 ct No Bid

92 Vita Fresh Pineapple orange juice Cartons 70/4oz 12.53$     70 ea No Bid

93 Hillshire Ham, 6/2 lb, Sliced 3.070$    36.82$    12 lbs 42.99$     6/2 lbs No Bid

94 Hillshire Turkey, 6/2 lb, Sliced 3.880$    46.60$    12 lbs 50.32$     6/2 lbs No Bid

95 Granola Bars Honey and Oats 33.06$    144 ea 28.93$     144 ea .74 oz No Bid

96 Lemonade Drink Mix 24.45$    12 ea 15.48$     12/2 gal No Bid

97 Pink Lemonade Drink Mix 24.45$    12 ea 15.48$     12/2 gal No Bid

98 Grape Drink Mix 15.48$     12/2 gal No Bid

99 Fruit Punch Drink Mix 24.45$    12 ea 15.48$     12/2 gal No Bid

100 Orange Drink Mix 24.45$    12 ea 15.48$     12/2 gal No Bid

NO BID

NO BID
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BID SHEET101 Carnation Instant breakfast - individual /verity No Bid

102 Maypo Cream of Wheat 25.70$    12 ea 20.85$     12/20oz No Bid

103 Quick Oats 12/42oz 30.00$    12 ea 25.98$     12 ea No Bid

104 Pancakes, 144/1.2 oz 12.87$    144 ea 13.91$     144 ea No Bid

105 Cream of chicken soup 12- 5# can 41.91$    12 ea 32.76$     12 ea 49.25 oz No Bid

106 Cream of mushroom soup 12- 5# can 40.23$    12 ea 32.46$     12 ea 49.05 oz No Bid

107 Chicken Base mix 1.570$    39.35$    25 lbs 31.12$     12/1 lb No Bid

108 Brown Gravy mix 19.66$    6 ea 13.01$     6 ea 14 oz No Bid

109 Pepper Gravy mix 15.50$    6 ea 10.70$     6 ea 24 oz No Bid

110 Zesty Orange Sauce, 4/half gal 27.97$    2 gal 36.96$     4/.5 gals No Bid

111 Lone Star Biscuits 2oz. 34.81$    168 ea 13.43$     72 ea No Bid

112 Brown Bags, 8 lb - 500 ct 10.82$    500 ct 11.91$     500 ct No Bid

113 Brown Hair Nets 20.42$    144 ea 8.94$       144 ct No Bid

114 Bun Pan Bags, 200 ct, 27" x 37" 49.19$    200 ea 16.76$     200 ct 17.76$ 

115 Mrs. Butterworth Frozen Waffles 10.63$    144 ea 13.51$     144 ea 1.27 oz No Bid

116 Mrs. Butterworth French Toast Frozen Pre-cooked 1.5oz 22.03$    144 ea 24.89$     144 ea No Bid

117 Flour tortillas 6" 25.61$    288 ea 15.25$     12/24 ct No Bid

NO BIDNO BID
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BID SHEET118 Pineapple Chunks #10 can 25.00$    6 cans 28.32$     6 cans No Bid

119 Syrup Pouch 1/5oz 6.34$       100 ea 6.87$       100 ea 1.5 oz No Bid

120 Low cal syrup Pouch 8.47$       100 ea 7.29$       100 ea 1 oz No Bid

121 Jello Gelatin Cups 48/3.5oz 15.93$    48 ea 20.78$     48 ea 3.25 oz No Bid

122 Soy Sauce 1/gal 17.33$    4 gal 31.55$     4 gals No Bid

123 Picante Sauce 4/1Gal. 29.53$    4 gal 29.44$     4 gals No Bid

124 Spaghetti Sauce #10 Can 26.07$    6 cans 21.29$     6 cans No Bid

125 Tortilla Chips 4 bags 6.70$       3/2 lbs No Bid

126 Egg Rolls Vegetarian 3oz 31.08$    100 ea 37.14$     6/12 ct No Bid

127 Bagels Cinnamon Raisin 2.3oz 23.72$    72 ea 19.54$     72 ea No Bid

128 Fruit Bowls Mixed Fruit 18.44$    36 ea 17.80$     36 ea 4 oz No Bid

129 Fruit Bowls Diced Peaches 18.44$    36 ea 17.80$     36 ea 4 oz No Bid

130 Kens BBQ Sauce 4/1 gal. 16.31$    4 gal 31.98$     4 gal No Bid

131 Burrito - Bean & Cheese 3oz 72ct 23.63$    64 ea 30.09$     72 ea 4 oz No Bid

132 Kellogg's Pop Tarts Frosted Cherry 32.61$     12/6pk/2ct No Bid

Alternate: Strawberry 36.51$    144 ea

133 Kellogg's Poptart Blueberry 36.51$    144 ea 32.61$     12/6pk/2ct No Bid

134 Cumin 5.230$    23.55$    4.5 lbs 4.33$       1 lb No Bid

NO BID
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BID SHEET135 Sara Lee Coffee Cake 40.84$    3 ea 33.62$     4/24 ea 1.7 oz No Bid

136 Milk Non Fat powdered 2 lb. Bag 2.190$    109.72$  50 lbs 47.22$     25 lbs No Bid

137 Worcestershire sauce 4/1 gal. 16.08$    4 gal 12.45$     4 gal No Bid

138 Mustard 4/1gal. 11.25$    4 gal 10.57$     4 gal No Bid

139 Idaho Potato Pearls 50.77$    12 ea 45.86$     12/26 oz No Bid

140 Cornstarch 24/16oz. 0.760$    18.20$    24 ea 15.74$     24/16 oz No Bid

141 Scouring Pad, Heavy Duty, Green, 6 x 9 6.45$       15 ea 3.19$       10 ea No Bid

142 Clear Wrap 11.10$    1 roll 25.80$     1 roll 1/18" x 3000' No Bid

143 Foil, Heavy Duty, 18" x 1000 ' 30.86$    1 roll 55.34$     1 roll No Bid

34.59$     1 roll Sub offered - Standard Duty

144 Glove, Food Handler 13.29$    1000 ea 6.32$       1000 ea 32.00$ 

145 Cup, 8 oz 17.61$    1000 ea 17.24$     1000 ea No Bid

146 Sporks 14.70$    1000 ea 7.53$       1000 ea 19.99$ 

147 Toweled, Rolled Paper 29.41$    30 ea 22.66$     12 ea 8" x 350' 29.89$ 

148 Gatorade, Instant Powder, 32 envelopes/cs 87.34$    32 ea 78.32$     32 ea 21 oz No Bid

149 Souffle Cup - 1 oz 40.37$    5000 ea 37.65$     5000 ea No Bid

150 Souffle Cup - 5 oz 27.04$    1250 ea 45.48$     2500 ea 5.5 oz No Bid

151 Plates, 10 1/4 Divided, Chinet or equivalent 35.40$    500 ea 34.92$     500 ea No Bid
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BID SHEET152 Plate, Paper, 8 3/4 28.19$    1200 ea 28.18$     12/100 ct No Bid

153 Bowl, Stryofoam, 8 oz 31.09$    1000 ea 31.51$     1000 ea No Bid

154 Sandwich Bags, fold over style 35.71$    2000 ea 10.39$     2000 ea 6.5" x 7" No Bid

155 Spoon, Plastic, 1000/cs 12.17$    1000 ea 7.53$       1000 ea 19.79$ 

156 Fork, Plastic, 1000/cs, med weight 12.28$    1000 ea 7.53$       1000 ea 19.65$ 

157 Vinegar, 1 gallon 7.49$       6 gal 10.28$     6 gal No Bid

158 Institutional Soap Pads 12.08$     6/10 ct No Bid

159 Bread, Wheat, Sliced, Loaf 24.03$     12/28 oz No Bid

160 Buns, Hamburger 7.70$       48 ea 25.51$     96 ea 3.2 oz No Bid

161 Buns, Hot Dog 11.77$    72 ea 21.56$     144 ea 1.5 oz No Bid

162 Turkey Patty #4040, 40-3.92oz/Bx 26.47$    40 ea 84.51$     128 ea 3.1 oz No Bid

NO BID

NO BID


